KAT23422 NNT S.L.C.

AMENDMENT NO. “alendar No.

Purpose: In the nature of a substitute.
IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES—118th Cong., 1st Sess.

S.1308

To amend the Indian Self-Determination and Education As-
sistance Act to extend the deadline for the Secretary
of the Interior to promulgate regulations implementing
title IV of that Act, and for other purposes.

Referred to the Committee on and
ordered to be printed

Ordered to lie on the table and to be printed

AMENDMENT IN THE NATURE OF A SUBSTITUTE Intended
to be proposed by Mr. HOEVEN (for himself and Ms. SMITH)

Viz:

| Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the fol-
2 lowing:

3 SECTION 1. EXTENSION OF DEADLINE TO PROMULGATE
4 CERTAIN REGULATIONS.

5 Section 413(a) of the Indian Self-Determination and
6 Education Assistance Act (25 U.S.C. 5373(a)) is amend-
7T ed—

8 (1) in paragraph (2), by striking “21 months”
9 and inserting “38 months’; and
10 (2) in paragraph (3), by striking “30 months”
11 and inserting ‘50 months”.



